

Certified Photocopy

Description/Specification	Qty	Unit	1. 8 DIMENSIONS TRADING AND SUPPLIES, INC.		2. PENITON TRADING		3. SEE MANUFACTURING		4. SOFT BOILED EGGS, INC.		
			Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	
1 Open Type Steel Racks 6-8 layers Height: 70-79 inches Width: 15 inches Length: 30-40 inches Steel Frame Approved Budget for the Contract: PHP75,000.00	15	set	6,500.00	97,500.00	5,000.00	75,000.00	4,588.00	68,820.00	-	-	
2 Refrigerator, 5-6 cu ft. Approved Budget for the Contract: PHP19,000.00	1	unit	18,900.00	18,900.00	19,000.00	19,000.00	-	-	13,500.00	13,500.00	
3 Water Dispenser Free Standing Hot and Cold Compressor Type Approved Budget for the Contract: PHP15,000.00	3	unit	7,500.00	22,500.00	-	-	-	-	4,985.00	14,955.00	
4 Alcohol Dispenser Automatic Wall mounted / Free Standing Approved Budget for the Contract: PHP6,000.00	3	unit	2,000.00	6,000.00	-	-	-	-	-	-	
SUPPLIER/DEALERS NAME			CONTACT PERSON		ADDRESS						TELFAX NOS.
8 DIMENSIONS TRADING AND SUPPLIES, INC.			Mr. Antonio Casucog		No. 33 Tandang Sora St., Parang, Marikina City						09178458071
PENITON TRADING			Ms. Gemma T. Peniton		L7 B1 Zabarte Road, Near Maria Luisa Subd., Camarin, Caloocan City						255-9876
SEE MANUFACTURING			Mr. Jose D. Seo		140 Aurora Blvd., San Juan City						09059904178
SOFT BOILED EGGS, INC.			Ms. Liz Santos		65 General Avenue, GSIS Village, Bgy. Tandang Sora, Quezon City						452-2568
			Total		6,000.00		No Bid		Total		No Bid
			Total		No Bid		No Bid		Total		Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder
			Total		No Bid		No Bid		Total		Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bidder

I hereby certify that I have verified this Abstract of  
 against the Price Quotation submitted by the suppliers/dealers.

*[Signature]*  
 JUAN B. REMUJARO  
 Chief Procurement Management Division  
 CPM - BAC, Secretariat Head

*[Signature]*  
 Milling Director IV MARIA VICTORIA M. SALAZAR  
 BAC Member - Financial

*[Signature]*  
 Director ARIEL V. VILLANUEVA  
 BAC Member - Legal

*[Signature]*  
 Atty. ARIEL G. RONQUILLO  
 Assistant Commissioner  
 Chairman, CSC Bids and Awards Committee (BAC)

*[Signature]*  
 Director FERNANDO M. PORIO  
 Vice Chairman, BAC

*[Signature]*  
 HARRIS B. WAGS, JR.  
 End-User